
A35-year-old man presented to his
family physician with complaints of

redness and discomfort in his left eye.
His family physician noted on examina-
tion that there appeared to be
“sparkles” in the patient’s eye (Figs. 1
and 2) and referred him for ophthalmo-
logic assessment. The patient said that
he had lost his sight in his left eye some
years before, although he could not re-
call precisely when this had occurred,
or the nature of his loss of vision. He
was mentally retarded to a mild degree,
but had no other medical problems.

Examination of this patient revealed
visual acuities of 20/20 in the right eye
and no light perception in the left eye.
Crystals could be seen layering inferi-
orly in the anterior chamber of the left
eye on gross examination. The pupil
was bound to the lens, with the lens it-
self being clear. There were also crys-
tals in the vitreous and a total funnel-
shaped retinal detachment. A diagnosis
of anterior chamber cholesterolosis was
reached.

It is believed that cholesterol is re-
leased from the breakdown of intraocu-
lar red blood cells and then crystallizes.
This may be secondary to trauma or
protracted inflammation.1 Vitreous he-
morrhage occurring in the posterior
chamber may cause cholesterol crystal
formation that is specifically termed
synchisis scintillans. Diffusion into the

anterior chamber is facilitated by
aphakia (absence of a lens) or lens sub-
luxation, but these conditions are not
required.2 Phacolysis (removal of the
lens) itself can also cause crystal forma-
tion, possibly from the degradation of
intralenticular membranes.3 Chronic
retinal detachment can cause leakage of
cholesterol-rich subretinal fluid without
hemorrhage, resulting in cholesterolo-
sis (the likely mechanism involved in

this case). Finally, cholesterol crystals in
the anterior chamber may also form in
situ and have been reported following
hyphema.4

The presence of crystals in the ante-
rior chamber always indicates some
serious underlying disorder1 requiring
ophthalmologic assessment. Microscopy
of an anterior chamber aspirate may re-
veal characteristic rectangular or rhom-
boid cholesterol crystals. Slit-lamp
specular microscopy has also been de-
scribed as a useful noninvasive diagnos-
tic tool.5 Other types of anterior cham-

ber crystals include calcium oxalate and
multiple myeloma, but these are even
rarer. 

Unfortunately, treatment options
for anterior chamber cholesterolosis
are limited and relate to the underly-
ing disease process. Steroids may be
used for reactive endophthalmitis and
in this case improved the patient’s
painful symptoms. Loss of vision,
however, is less amenable to treat-
ment, except when phacolysis is the
underlying cause.1
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The presence of crystals in 
the anterior chamber always

indicates some serious underlying
disorder requiring

ophthalmologic assessment
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